No. 37 p. 1453
SUPPLEMENTARY GAZETTE

THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

ADELAIDE, FRIDAY, 10 JUNE 2022

CONTENTS

GOVERNOR’S INSTRUMENTS
APPOINTMENLS ...ttt 1454
Proclamation—
Youth Court (Designation and Classification of
Magistrates) Proclamation 2022............ccccoeveirniinnccnns 1456
Regulations—
Private Parking Areas (Expiation Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2022—No. 26 0f 2022........cccceeirruiinnuenenne 1457
Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) (Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2022—No. 27 0f 2022........ccoeueuirrueinnencnns 1459
Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery (Prescribed
Amounts) Amendment Regulations 2022—

NO. 28 0£ 2022 ..o 1461
Environment Protection (Fees) Amendment

Regulations 2022—No. 29 0f 2022........ccoovveireueinnecnns 1463
Mining (Rental Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022—

NO. 30 0£2022 ..ot 1468
Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) (Expiation Fees)

Amendment Regulations 2022—No. 31 0f 2022 ............... 1470
Motor Vehicles (Expiation Fees) Amendment

Regulations 2022—No. 32 0f 2022......cccevievienerieieieene 1493

Heavy Vehicle National Law (South Australia)
(Expiation Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022—

NO. 3302022 .t 1498
Expiation of Offences (Fees) Amendment

Regulations 2022—No. 34 0f 2022......cccoeeeienenieienieene 1508
Victims of Crime (Fund and Levy) Amendment

Regulations 2022— No. 35 0f2022......ccccovevivinieiniene 1509

All instruments appearing in this gazette are to be considered official, and obeyed as such

Printed and published weekly by authority of S. SMITH, Government Printer, South Australia
$8.00 per issue (plus postage), $402.00 per annual subscription—GST inclusive
Online publications: www.governmentgazette.sa.gov.au



http://www.governmentgazette.sa.gov.au/

No. 37 p. 1454 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022

GOVERNOR’S INSTRUMENTS

APPOINTMENTS

Department of the Premier and Cabinet
Adelaide, 10 June 2022

Her Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has been pleased to appoint the undermentioned to the Construction Industry Training
Board, pursuant to the provisions of the Construction Industry Training Fund Act 1993:

Member: from 20 June 2022 until 19 June 2023
John Clifford Chapman
Andrew David Clarke
William Wreford Frogley
Peter David Russell
Stephen Charles Knight
Pasquale Gerace
Maree Lyn Wauchope
Rebecca Louise Pickering
Patrick John Curran
Mardi Ann Conduit

Deputy Member: from 20 June 2022 until 19 June 2023
Symon Grant Paproth (Deputy to Clarke)
Ilario Roccisano (Deputy to Wauchope)
Estha Marie van der Linden (Deputy to Frogley)
Melissa Jayne Ekberg (Deputy to Pickering)
Thomas Henry Game (Deputy to Conduit)
Gary Henderson (Deputy to Russell)

Presiding Member: from 20 June 2022 until 19 June 2023
John Clifford Chapman

By command,
CHRISTOPHER JAMES PICTON, MP

For Premier
22MEO012

Department of the Premier and Cabinet
Adelaide, 10 June 2022

Her Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has been pleased to appoint Dr James Muecke AM as Governor's Deputy of South
Australia for the periods from 7.00am on Wednesday, 15 June 2022 until 5.00pm on Thursday, 16 June 2022 and 11.15am on Thursday,
23 June 2022 until 8.30pm on Friday, 24 June 2022.

By command,

CHRISTOPHER JAMES PICTON, MP
For Premier

Department of the Premier and Cabinet
Adelaide, 10 June 2022

Her Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has been pleased to appoint judicial officers to the auxiliary pool for a period
commencing on 1 July 2022 and expiring on 30 June 2023, it being a condition of appointment that the powers and jurisdictions of office
should only be exercised during the time or times the actual duties are being undertaken, but at no other time throughout the period of
appointment - pursuant to the provisions of the Judicial Administration (Auxiliary Appointments and Powers) Act 1988.

David Harvey Peek as an Auxiliary Judge of the Supreme Court

Gregory John Parker as an Auxiliary Judge of the Supreme Court

Rauf Soulio as an Auxiliary Judge of the Supreme Court

Jodie Marieka Carrel as an Auxiliary Magistrate and Auxiliary Deputy President of the South Australian Employment Tribunal

John Gerard Fahey as an Auxiliary Magistrate and an Auxiliary Master of the District Court

Derek Yorke Nevill Sprod as an Auxiliary Magistrate

Yoong Fee Chin as an Auxiliary Magistrate

Geraldine Davison as an Auxiliary Judge of the Supreme Court

Graham Walter Dart as an Auxiliary Judge of the Supreme Court

Katrina Jane Bochner as an Auxiliary Judge of the Supreme Court

Sydney William Tilmouth as an Auxiliary Judge of the Supreme Court

Brian Patrick Gilchrist as an Auxiliary Judge of the Supreme Court

Peter John Norman as an Auxiliary Master of the Supreme Court and as an Auxiliary Master of the District Court

John Stephen Roder as an Auxiliary Master of the Supreme Court and as an Auxiliary Master of the District Court

Briony Kennewell as an Auxiliary Master of the Supreme Court

Christina Rose Flourentzou as an Auxiliary Master of the Supreme Court and as an Auxiliary Master of the District Court

Gordon Fraser Barrett as an Auxiliary Judge of the District Court

John Francis Costello as an Auxiliary Judge of the District Court and Environment Resources and Development Court

Mark Nicholas Rice as an Auxiliary Master of the District Court

Peter Dennis Hannon as an Auxiliary Judge of the District Court and Deputy President of the South Australian Employment Tribunal

Dean Ernest Clayton as an Auxiliary Judge of the District Court and Deputy President of the South Australian Employment Tribunal

Alfio Anthony Grasso as an Auxiliary Magistrate



10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1455

Phillip Edward James Broderick as an Auxiliary Magistrate
Theodore Iuliano as an Auxiliary Magistrate

Clive William Kitchin as an Auxiliary Magistrate
Elizabeth Ann Sheppard as an Auxiliary Magistrate
Terence Frederick Forrest as an Auxiliary Magistrate
Barbara Ellen Johns as an Auxiliary Magistrate

By command,

CHRISTOPHER JAMES PICTON, MP

For Premier
AGO0043-22CS

Department of the Premier and Cabinet
Adelaide, 10 June 2022

Her Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has been pleased to appoint the Honourable Justice Michael John Buss and the
Honourable Justice Robert Anthony Mazza as Judges of the Court of Appeal Division of the Supreme Court of South Australia on an
auxiliary basis, for terms commencing on 1 July 2022 and expiring on 30 June 2023, it being a condition of appointment that the powers
and jurisdictions of the office should only be exercised during the time or times the actual duties are being undertaken, but at no other time
throughout the period of appointment - pursuant to the Judicial Administration (Auxiliary Appointments and Powers) Act 1988.

By command,

CHRISTOPHER JAMES PICTON, MP

For Premier
AGO0043-22CS




No. 37 p. 1456 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022

PROCLAMATION
South Australia

Youth Court (Designation and Classification of Magistrates)
Proclamation 2022

under section 9 of the Youth Court Act 1993

1—Short title

This proclamation may be cited as the Youth Court (Designation and Classification of
Magistrates) Proclamation 2022.

2—Commencement

This proclamation comes into operation on 1 July 2022.

3—Designation and classification of magistrates
The auxiliary magistrates named in Schedule 1 are—
(a) designated as magistrates of the Youth Court of South Australia; and

(b) classified as members of the Court's ancillary judiciary.

Schedule 1—Magistrates of the Court
Phillip Edward James Broderick
Theodore luliano

Clive William Kitchin

Alfio Anthony Grasso

Elizabeth Ann Sheppard
Barbara Ellen Johns

John Gerard Fahey

Derek Yorke Nevill Sprod
Yoong Fee Chin

Terence Frederick Forrest
Made by the Governor

with the advice and consent of the Executive Council
on 10 June 2022



10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1457

REGULATIONS
South Australia

Private Parking Areas (Expiation Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2022

under the Private Parking Areas Act 1986

Contents

Part 1—Preliminary

1 Short title
2 Commencement

Part 2—Amendment of Private Parking Areas Regulations 2014

Amendment of regulation 7—Purpose other than parking
Amendment of regulation 8—Damage to signs etc

Amendment of regulation 10—Owner and driver guilty of offence
Amendment of regulation 11—Further offence each hour
Amendment of regulation 15—Expiation of offences against Act

NN D AW

Part 1—Preliminary

1—Short title

These regulations may be cited as the Private Parking Areas (Expiation Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2022.

2—Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2022.

Part 2—Amendment of Private Parking Areas Regulations 2014

3—Amendment of regulation 7—Purpose other than parking
Regulation 7, expiation fee—delete "$56" and substitute:
$57

4—Amendment of regulation 8—Damage to signs etc

Regulation 8, expiation fee—delete "$103" and substitute:
$105

5—Amendment of regulation 10—Owner and driver guilty of offence

Regulation 10, expiation fee—delete paragraphs (a) to (d) (inclusive) of the expiation fee
and substitute:

(a) for an alleged contravention of regulation 4(1)(a)—$56;
(b) for an alleged contravention of regulation 4(1)(b)—$69;

(¢) for an alleged contravention of regulation 5—$89;



No. 37 p. 1458 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022
(d) for an alleged contravention of regulation 6—$87.
6—Amendment of regulation 11—Further offence each hour
Regulation 11, expiation fee—delete "$55" and substitute:
§56
7T—Amendment of regulation 15—Expiation of offences against Act
Regulation 15, table—delete the table and substitute:
Section Expiation
Fee
section 8(1) $106
section 8(2) $413
section 8(3) $72
section 8(4) $75
section 8(5) $73
section 8(6) $58

Editorial Note—

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Legislative Instruments Act 1978, the Minister has certified that, in
the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into operation as set out in

these regulations.

Made by the Governor

with the advice and consent of the Executive Council

on 10 June 2022
No 26 of 2022


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Legislative%20Instruments%20Act%201978

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1459

South Australia

Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) (Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2022

under the Road Traffic Act 1961

Contents

Part 1—Preliminary

1 Short title
2 Commencement

Part 2—Amendment of Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) Regulations 2014
3 Amendment of Schedule 3—Fees

Part 1—Preliminary

1—Short title

These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) (Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2022.

2—Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2022.

Part 2—Amendment of Road Traffic (Miscellaneous)
Regulations 2014

3—Amendment of Schedule 3—Fees
(1)  Schedule 3, clause 1(2), table—delete the table and substitute:

Type of vehicle and inspection Fee
1. Heavy vehicles and buses
(1) Inspection of a motor vehicle (other than a bus) $272

(2) Inspection of—

(a)  aconverter dolly $92
(b)  atrailer other than a converter dolly $183
(3) Inspection of a bus $272
(4) Further inspection of a vehicle $92
2. Vehicles other than heavy vehicles or buses
(1) Inspection of a vehicle for the purposes of an $272

exemption under section 163AA of the Act or
regulation 71

(2) Inspection of a vehicle for the purposes of $272
section 139(1)(c) of the Motor Vehicles Act 1959


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Motor%20Vehicles%20Act%201959

No. 37 p. 1460 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022

Type of vehicle and inspection Fee
(3) Inspection of LPG-converted vehicle for the purposes $272
of the Dangerous Substances Act 1979
(4) Any other inspection of a vehicle $183
(5) Further inspection of a vehicle $92
(2) Schedule 3, clause 1(3)—delete "$26" and substitute:
$27
(3) Schedule 3, clause 1(4)—delete "$62" and substitute:
$63
(4) Schedule 3, clause 2(2)(a)—delete "$88" and substitute:
$90
(5) Schedule 3, clause 2(2)(b)(i)—delete "$57" and substitute:
$58
(6) Schedule 3, clause 2(2)(b)(ii)—delete "$294" and substitute:
$300

Editorial note—

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Legislative Instruments Act 1978, the Minister has certified that, in
the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into operation as set out in
these regulations.

Made by the Governor

with the advice and consent of the Executive Council
on 10 June 2022

No 27 0f 2022


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Dangerous%20Substances%20Act%201979
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Legislative%20Instruments%20Act%201978

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1461

South Australia

Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery (Prescribed
Amounts) Amendment Regulations 2022

under the Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery Act 2017

Contents

Part 1—Preliminary

1 Short title
2 Commencement

Part 2—Amendment of Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery Regulations 2018

3 Amendment of regulation 6—Amounts unpaid or unrecovered for more than certain period
(section 14 of Act)

4 Amendment of regulation 19—Amounts unpaid or unrecovered for more than certain period
(section 26 of Act)

Part 1—Preliminary

1—Short title

These regulations may be cited as the Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery (Prescribed
Amounts) Amendment Regulations 2022.

2—Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2022.

Part 2—Amendment of Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery
Regulations 2018
3—Amendment of regulation 6—Amounts unpaid or unrecovered for more than
certain period (section 14 of Act)
(1) Regulation 6(1)—delete "$110" and substitute:
$112
(2) Regulation 6(2)—delete "$201" and substitute:
$205
4—Amendment of regulation 19—Amounts unpaid or unrecovered for more than
certain period (section 26 of Act)
(1) Regulation 19(1)—delete "$110" and substitute:
$112
(2) Regulation 19(2)—delete "$201" and substitute:
$205



No. 37 p. 1462 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022

Editorial note—

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Legislative Instruments Act 1978, the Minister has certified that, in
the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into operation as set out in
these regulations.

Made by the Governor

with the advice and consent of the Executive Council
on 10 June 2022

No 28 0f 2022


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Legislative%20Instruments%20Act%201978

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1463

South Australia

Environment Protection (Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2022

under the Environment Protection Act 1993

Contents

Part 1—Preliminary

1 Short title
2 Commencement

Part 2—Amendment of Environment Protection Regulations 2009

3 Substitution of Schedule 4
Schedule 4—Fees and levy
Part 1—Fees

1 Fee unit
2 Miscellaneous fees

Part 2—Waste depot levy
3 Waste depot levy

Part 1—Preliminary

1—Short title

These regulations may be cited as the Environment Protection (Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2022.

2—Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2022.

Part 2—Amendment of Environment Protection Regulations 2009

3—Substitution of Schedule 4
Schedule 4—delete the Schedule and substitute:

Schedule 4—Fees and levy
Part 1—Fees

1—Fee unit

In these regulations (except Part 2 of this Schedule), the monetary value of
a fee unit is—

(a) for the purposes of the annual authorisation fee for a licence
(including a projected annual authorisation fee under regulation
27(4) and (5)—

(1) for the flat fee component—3$74.00;



No. 37 p. 1464 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

10 June 2022

(i) for the environment management component—3$826.00;

(iii)  for the pollutant load-based component—$7.30;

(iv) for the water reuse component—$18.30;

(b) for all other purposes—$22.70.

2—Miscellaneous fees

1 Application for approval of the transfer of an
environmental authorisation (section 49(5) of the Act)—

(a)

if the authorisation fee last paid or payable was
less than $1 000

(b)

if the authorisation fee last paid or payable was
not less than $1 000 but not more than $1 999

if the authorisation fee last paid or payable was
not less than $2 000 but not more than $4 999

(c)

(d)

if the authorisation fee last paid or payable was
not less than $5 000 but not more than $9 999

(e)

if the authorisation fee last paid or payable was
not less than $10 000 but not more than $49 999

¢

if the authorisation fee last paid or payable was
$50 000 or more

2 Beverage container approvals and annual fees (Part 8
Division 2 of the Act)—

(a)

application for approval of a class of containers
as category A or category B containers
(section 68 of the Act)—

(M)
(i)
(iii)
(iv)
™)

for 1 class of container

for 2 to 5 classes of container (inclusive)
for 6 to 10 classes of container (inclusive)
for 11 to 20 classes of container (inclusive)

for more than 20 classes of container

(b)

application for approval to operate a collection
depot (section 69 of the Act)—
(1)  for a collection depot other than a reverse
vending machine
(i)  for a reverse vending machine
application for approval to carry on business as a
super collector (section 69 of the Act)

(c)

(d)

annual fee for operating a collection depot
(section 69A of the Act)—
(i)  for a collection depot within metropolitan
Adelaide
(ii))  for a collection depot outside metropolitan
Adelaide

annual fee for carrying on business as a super
collector (section 69A of the Act)

(e)

5 fee units

10 fee units

20 fee units

30 fee units

50 fee units

100 fee
units

15 fee units
25 fee units
37 fee units
61 fee units

109 fee

units

7 fee units

18 fee units

43 fee units

15 fee units

7.5 fee units

32 fee units



10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1465

3 Accreditation as site contamination auditor
(section 103V of the Act and Part 5 Division 5 of the
regulations)—

(a) application for accreditation (regulation 54) $557.00

(b)  grant of accreditation (regulation 55) or renewal $5 723.00
of accreditation (regulation 59)

(c)  annual fee for accreditation regulation 58) $3 312.00

(d) replacement of certificate of accreditation or $74.00
identity card (regulation 62)

4 Inspection of the register (section 109(5) of the Act)—
(a)  each manual inspection 1 fee unit
(b)  each inspection requiring access to a computer—

(i)  for the first 10 minutes (or part of that 1 fee unit
10 minutes) of access

(ii))  for each additional 10 minutes (or part of 1 fee unit
that 10 minutes) of access

5  Copy of part of the register (section 109(6) of the Act)—
(a) first page $5.80
(b)  each additional page $2.10

Part 2—Waste depot levy

3—Waste depot levy

(1) Pursuant to section 113 of the Act (but subject to Part 6 of these regulations
and this clause), the prescribed levy payable by the holder of a licence to
conduct a waste disposal depot in respect of waste received at the depot
15—

(a)  for solid waste—

(i)  in the case of a licence holder that is a council $74.50
that has made an election under regulation 75
(per tonne of solid waste disposed of at the
depot)

(i1)  in the case of the holder of a licence to conduct
a landfill depot or incineration depot (not being
a licence holder referred to in subparagraph (1))
(per tonne of designated solid waste disposed
of, used or handled at the depot)—

(A) if the depot is situated outside of $74.50
metropolitan Adelaide and the waste has
been brought to the depot by or on behalf
of premises where the waste was

generated situated outside of metropolitan
Adelaide

(B) if the depot is situated within metropolitan $74.50
Adelaide and the waste has been brought
to the depot by or on behalf of a council
the area of which lies wholly outside of
metropolitan Adelaide

(C) in any other case $149.00



No. 37 p. 1466 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022
(b)  for liquid waste (per kilolitre disposed of at the $40.50
depot)

2

3)

(4)

If under the licence the waste disposal depot is required to cover landfill at
the depot with material on a daily or more frequent basis, the amount of the
levy payable in respect of the waste under subclause (1)(a)(ii) is to be
subject to a deduction calculated in accordance with the following formula:

PCDxW x LR

where—
PCD is the percentage cover deduction of 10%

W is the total amount of designated solid waste (in tonnes) disposed of
(including any waste used as cover for landfill) at the depot in the relevant
period

LR is the average levy rate paid per tonne of solid waste disposed of at the
depot in the relevant period (excluding any solid waste in respect of which
payment of all or part of the levy is waived or refunded under section 116
of the Act).

Note—

To the extent to which the calculation of the levy payable under this clause
following the application of the deduction under this subclause results in an
amount that is less than $0, that amount, to the extent that it is less than $0,
is to be disregarded and may not be carried over to another period.

For the purposes of this clause, designated solid waste means the following
solid waste (including waste fill):

(a) solid waste disposed of at the depot;

(b) solid waste used as cover for landfill at the depot on a daily or
more frequent basis;

(c) solid waste used at the depot for an operational use, other than an
approved operational use;

(d) solid waste that is the subject of unauthorised stockpiling at the
depot;

(e) solid waste that has been stockpiled at the depot in contravention
of the relevant licence.

In this clause—
approved operational use has the same meaning as in regulation 69A;

incineration depot means a depot, facility or works referred to in
Schedule 1 Part A clause 3(3)(c) of the Act;

landfill depot means a depot, facility or works referred to in Schedule 1
Part A clause 3(3)(a) of the Act;

operational use has the same meaning as in regulation 68A(1);

waste disposal depot means a depot, facility or works referred to in
Schedule 1 Part A clause 3(3) of the Act.



10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1467

Editorial note—

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Legislative Instruments Act 1978, the Minister has certified that, in
the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into operation as set out in

these regulations.

Made by the Governor

with the advice and consent of the Executive Council
on 10 June 2022

No 29 0f 2022


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Legislative%20Instruments%20Act%201978

No. 37 p. 1468 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022

South Australia

Mining (Rental Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022

under the Mining Act 1971

Contents

Part 1—Preliminary

1 Short title

2 Commencement

Part 2—Amendment of Mining Regulations 2020
3 Substitution of Schedule 2

Schedule 2—Rental

Part 1—Preliminary

1—Short title
These regulations may be cited as the Mining (Rental Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022.

2—Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2022.

Part 2—Amendment of Mining Regulations 2020

3—Substitution of Schedule 2
Schedule 2—delete the Schedule and substitute:

Schedule 2—Rental

1 Mining lease $271.00 or $72.00 for
each hectare or part of a hectare

in the area of the lease, whichever

is the greater

2 Mining lease—extractives $230.00 or $59.50 for each
hectare or part of a hectare in the

area of the lease, whichever is the

greater

3 Retention lease—

(a)  if the retention lease authorises the
carrying out of only exploration
operations under the lease—

(i)  ifthe lease is granted for a term $1 010.00 or $23.40 per km® in
of less than 5 years (or an the area of the lease, whichever is
aggregate term of 5 years); or the greater



10 June 2022

THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

No. 37 p. 1469

(i)  if the term or aggregate term of $271.00 or $36.50 for each
the lease has reached the period hectare or part of a hectare in the
of 5 years from the grant date,  area of the lease, whichever is the

and the lease is renewed for a greater
period of less than 5 years (or
an aggregate term of 5 years);
or
(iii)  if the term or aggregate term of $271.00 or $106.00 for each

the lease has reached the period hectare or part of a hectare in the
of 10 years from the grant date, area of the lease, whichever is the

and the lease is renewed for a greater
further period or periods; or
(b)  in any other case $271.00 or $36.50 for each

4 Miscellaneous purposes licence

Editorial note—

hectare or part of a hectare in the
area of the lease, whichever is the

greater

$271.00 or $72.00 for each

hectare or part of a hectare in the
area of the licence, whichever is

the greater

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Legislative Instruments Act 1978, the Minister has certified that, in
the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into operation as set out in

these regulations.

Made by the Governor

with the advice and consent of the Executive Council

on 10 June 2022
No 30 of 2022


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Legislative%20Instruments%20Act%201978

No. 37 p. 1470 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022

South Australia

Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) (Expiation Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2022

under the Road Traffic Act 1961

Contents

Part 1—Preliminary

1 Short title
2 Commencement

Part 2—Amendment of Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) Regulations 2014
3 Substitution of Schedule 4

Schedule 4—Expiation of offences

Part —Preliminary

1 Expiation of alleged offences

2 Photographic detection devices

3 Expiation fee for certain offences at average speed camera locations

4 Expiation fee for certain Road Rules contraventions within 100 metres of Safe-T-Cam photographic
detection device

5 Lesser expiation fee if motor vehicle not involved

6 Prescribed roads—offences against section 45A of Act involving road trains

Part 2—Offences against the Road Traffic Act 1961
Part 3—Offences against the Australian Road Rules
Part 4—Offences against the Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) Regulations 2014

Part 5—Offences against the Road Traffic (Road Rules—Ancillary and Miscellaneous
Provisions) Regulations 2014

Part 1—Preliminary

1—Short title

These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) (Expiation Fees)
Amendment Regulations 2022.

2—Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2022.



10 June 2022

THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1471

Part 2—Amendment of Road Traffic (Miscellaneous)
Regulations 2014

3—Substitution of Schedule 4
Schedule 4—delete the Schedule and substitute:

Schedule 4—Expiation of offences

Part 1—Preliminary

1—Expiation of alleged offences

(M

)

The expiation fees set out in this Schedule are fixed for alleged offences
against the Act or the rules or regulations specified in this Schedule.

Text set out in italic type under a heading in this Schedule commencing
with the words "Description of offence" is a description for convenience
purposes only and is not to be taken to define the offence for which a
particular amount is fixed as the expiation fee.

2—Photographic detection devices

The expiation fee for an alleged offence against section 79B(2) of the Act
constituted of being the owner of a vehicle that appears from evidence
obtained through the operation of a photographic detection device to have
been involved in the commission of an expiable offence is the same as the
expiation fee payable for that expiable offence.

3—Expiation fee for certain offences at average speed camera

locations

Despite any other provision of this Schedule, the expiation fee for—
(a) an alleged offence constituted of a contravention of or failure to
comply with—
(1) rule 132(2) of the Australian Road Rules (Keeping to the
left of the centre of a road or the dividing line); or

(i1) rule 150(1) of the Australian Road Rules (Driving on or
across a continuous white edge line); or

(b) an alleged offence against section 164A(1) of the Road Traffic
Act 1961 constituted of a contravention of or failure to comply
with section 110 of the Act (Driving on sealed surface),

is $1 023 if the contravention or failure to comply takes place
within 100 metres of a stub line at an average speed camera location.

4—Expiation fee for certain Road Rules contraventions

within 100 metres of Safe-T-Cam photographic detection device

Despite any other provision of this Schedule, the expiation fee for an
alleged offence constituted of contravention by the driver of a heavy
vehicle of any of the following provisions of the Australian Road Rules

is $627 if the contravention takes place within 100 metres of a Safe-T-Cam
photographic detection device:

(a) rule 95(1) (Emergency stopping lane only signs);


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20Act%201961
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20Act%201961
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

No. 37 p. 1472

THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022

(b) rule 126 (Keeping a safe distance behind vehicles);

(c) rule 127(1) (Keeping a minimum distance between long vehicles);

(d) rule 132(2) (Keeping to the left of the centre of a road or the
dividing line);

(e) rule 146(1) (Driving within a single marked lane or line of traffic);

(f) rule 147 (Moving from one marked lane to another marked lane
across a continuous line separating the lanes);

(g) rule 150(1) (Driving on or across a continuous white edge line);

(h) rule 215(1) (Using lights when driving at night or in hazardous
weather conditions).

S5—Lesser expiation fee if motor vehicle not involved

(M

)

Despite the fees fixed in the tables in this Schedule, the expiation fee is $63
for an alleged offence (other than an offence referred to in subclause (2))
constituted of—

(a) driving, towing, stopping or parking a vehicle other than a motor
vehicle; or

(b) travelling in or on a wheeled recreational device or wheeled toy.
Subclause (1) does not apply in the case of—

(a) an offence constituted of failing to comply with the lawful
directions of a person; or

(b) an offence constituted of driving, towing, stopping, parking or
travelling in or on, an electric personal transporter; or

(¢) an offence against section 164A(1) of the Act comprising a
contravention of or failure to comply with section 99B(1),
162C(1), 162C(2) or 162C(2a) of the Act; or

(d) an offence against rule 240(1), 240(2), 241(1), 244(2), 244B,
244C, 254(2), 256(1), 256(2) or 256(3) of the Australian Road
Rules.

6—Prescribed roads—offences against section 45A of Act involving

)

2

road trains

For the purposes of determining the expiation fee for an offence against
section 45A of the Act, a road train is driven on a prescribed road if it is
driven on a length of road with a prescribed speed limit (road trains)

of 90 kilometres per hour or more.

In this clause—

prescribed speed limit (road trains) means a prescribed speed limit (road
trains) imposed under regulation 8(4) of the Road Traffic (Road Rules—
Ancillary and Miscellaneous Provisions) Regulations 2014.

Note—

Different penalties apply in respect of road trains being driven on prescribed roads—
see the item relating to offences against section 45A in Part 2 of this Schedule.


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20(Road%20Rules%E2%80%94Ancillary%20and%20Miscellaneous%20Provisions)%20Regulations%202014
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20(Road%20Rules%E2%80%94Ancillary%20and%20Miscellaneous%20Provisions)%20Regulations%202014

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1473

Part 2—Offences against the Road Traffic Act 1961

Section Description of offence against Road Traffic Act 1961 Fee

21(1a) Placing speed limit sign on road without relevant $1 275
authorisation in contravention of section 20(3) or closing
portion of prescribed road without roadworks permit in
contravention of section 20(5)

21(3) Holder of approval or roadworks permit failing to comply $1 275
with condition of approval or permit relating to signs or other
traffic control devices used in connection with work area or
work site

40H(5) Engaging in conduct in contravention of direction of
authorised officer or police officer to stop vehicle, or not
move it, or not interfere with vehicle or its equipment or

load—
(a)  if direction relates to heavy vehicle $746
(b) if direction relates to light vehicle $308
401(2) Engaging in conduct in contravention of direction of

authorised officer or police officer to move vehicle to
specified location—

(a) if direction relates to heavy vehicle $746
(b) if direction relates to light vehicle $308
40J(3) Engaging in conduct in contravention of direction of $308

authorised officer or police officer to move light vehicle or do
anything else reasonably required by officer to avoid causing
harm or obstruction

40K(5) Engaging in conduct in contravention of direction of
authorised officer or police officer to vacate or not occupy
driver's seat, or to leave or not enter vehicle—

(a) if direction relates to heavy vehicle $746
(b) if direction relates to light vehicle $308
40V(4) Person subject to direction contravening or failing to comply

with section—
contravention specified in section 40V (4)(b)(1) $825

40W(4) Engaging in conduct in contravention of direction of $825
authorised officer or police officer to produce records,
devices or other things

40X(3) Person subject to direction contravening or failing to comply
with section—

contravention specified in section 40X(3)(b)(i) $746

40Y(5) Engaging in conduct in contravention of direction of $746
authorised officer or police officer to provide assistance to
officer to enable effective exercise of officer's powers

45A Driving at speed exceeding applicable speed limit by 45 kph
or more—


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20Act%201961

No. 37 p. 1474 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022
Section Description of offence against Road Traffic Act 1961 Fee
(a)  if vehicle being driven is a road train being driven $1 825
on a prescribed road
Note—
See clause 6 of this Schedule.
(b)  in any other case $1 756
45C(1) Driver of truck or bus on prescribed road exceeding the speed $1 098
limit by 10 kph or more
45C(2) Driver of truck or bus on prescribed road failing to engage $1 098
low gear
47B(1) Driving whilst having prescribed concentration of alcohol in
blood—
contravention involving less than 0.08 grams of $786
alcohol in 100 millilitres of blood
47BA(1) Driving with prescribed drug in oral fluid or blood $786
47BA(la)  Engaging in conduct involving motor vehicle that constitutes $786
offence against section 47BA(1) while child under age of
16 years is present in or on that motor vehicle
86A(3) Failing to obtain ticket from parking ticket-vending machine $58
where no fee payable
91(3) Person subject to direction or request of ferry operator failing
to comply with section—
failure to comply other than by giving false $372
information
110C(2) Selling or offering for sale for use on roads motor vehicle or
trailer not bearing vehicle identification plate for that vehicle
or trailer—
offence not committed in course of trade or business $303
110C(3) Driving motor vehicle or trailer not bearing vehicle $303
identification plate for that vehicle or trailer
117(1) Light vehicle in breach of light vehicle standards or $463
maintenance requirement driven on road—being driver of
vehicle
118(1) Light vehicle in breach of light vehicle standards or $463
maintenance requirement driven on road—being operator of
vehicle
123 Light vehicle not complying with light vehicle mass,
dimension or load restraint requirement driven on road—
being driver of vehicle—
(a) exceeding a mass limit by less than 50% $249
(b) exceeding a mass limit by 50% or more $497
(c¢) contravening a dimension or load restraint $249
requirement
124(1) Light vehicle not complying with light vehicle mass,
dimension or load restraint requirement driven on road—
being operator of vehicle—
(a) exceeding a mass limit by less than 50% $249


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20Act%201961

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1475
Section Description of offence against Road Traffic Act 1961 Fee
(b)  exceeding a mass limit by 50% or more $497
(c) contravening a dimension or load restraint $249
requirement
146(3) Engaging in conduct in contravention of direction of $308
authorised officer to driver or operator of light vehicle to
rectify specified breaches of light vehicle mass, dimension or
load restraint requirement, or move vehicle to specified
location and not proceed from there until breaches are
rectified
146(8) Engaging in conduct in contravention of condition of $308
authorisation granted by authorised officer to driver of light
vehicle authorising vehicle to continue journey
164A(1) Contravening or failing to comply with provision of Act
Contravention of or failure to comply with—
s 33(9) Failing to comply with direction of police officer $308
s 53B(1)  Selling radar detector or jammer or storing or $476
offering radar detector or jammer for sale
s 82(1) Speeding while passing school bus
Exceeding the speed limit while passing a school
bus—
by less than 10 kph $187
by 10 kph or more but less than 20 kph $422
by 20 kph or more but less than 30 kph $858
by 30 kph or more $1 560
s 83(1)(a) Speeding in emergency service speed zone
Exceeding 25 kph in emergency service speed
zone—
by less than 10 kph $187
by 10 kph or more but less than 20 kph $422
by 20 kph or more but less than 30 kph $858
by 30 kph or more $1 560
s 85(2) Leaving stationary vehicle in prohibited area $138
near Parliament House etc without authority
s 87 Walking without due care or attention etc $54
s 95 Riding on vehicle without consent of driver $115
s 99A Bicycle rider riding on footpath or other $63

road-related area failing to give warning to
pedestrians etc

s 99B(1)  Riding wheeled recreational device or wheeled
toy on road without due care or attention etc


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20Act%201961

No. 37 p. 1476 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

10 June 2022

Section Description of offence against Road Traffic Act 1961

Fee

s 99B(2)

s 99B(3)

s 107(1)

s 107(2)

s 108(1)

s110

s 145(3)

s 145(5f)

s 145(6)

s 161A(1)

s 162C(1)

where riding a wheeled recreational device
on a road that is—

. a one-way road with 2 or more
marked lanes (other than bicycle
lanes); or

. a two-way road with 2 or more
marked lanes (other than bicycle
lanes), on either side of the road,
for vehicles travelling in the same
direction; or

. a road on which the speed limit is
greater than 60 kph

in any other case

Riding wheeled recreational device or wheeled
toy on footpath or other road-related area
abreast of another vehicle etc

Riding wheeled recreational device or wheeled
toy on footpath or other road-related area
without giving warning to pedestrians etc

Driving, drawing, hauling, dragging over road
any implement, sledge etc

Removing or interfering with road infrastructure,
or damaging road infrastructure other than by
reasonable use

Depositing certain articles or materials on road

Failing to keep whole of vehicle on sealed
surface when driving on sealed road

Failing to comply with direction of police officer
or authorised officer to stop light vehicle or
produce light vehicle for examination

Defacing, altering, obscuring or removing
defective vehicle label affixed to light vehicle

Driving, selling etc light vehicle contrary to
terms of defect notice

Driving light vehicle to which section 1614
applies without Ministerial approval

(a)  where vehicle being driven is a bicycle
that has an auxiliary motor comprised
(in whole or in part) of an internal
combustion engine

(b) in any other case

Riding wheeled recreational device or wheeled
toy without wearing safety helmet complying with
regulations and properly adjusted and securely

fastened

$422

$63
$63

$63

$270

$270

$260
$115

$308

$463

$663

$416

$334
$115


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20Act%201961

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1477
Section Description of offence against Road Traffic Act 1961 Fee
s 162C(2) Riding wheeled recreational device or wheeled $115
toy on which is carried child under 16 years not
wearing safety helmet complying with
regulations and properly adjusted and securely
fastened
s 162C(2a) Parent or other person having custody or care of $111
child under 16 years causing or permitting child
to ride or be carried on wheeled recreational
device or wheeled toy without wearing safety
helmet complying with regulations and properly
adjusted and securely fastened
167(1) Causing or permitting another person to commit an offence
against Act or regulations—
causing or permitting commission of expiable the
offence expiation
fee
prescribed
for the
expiable
offence
174B Further offence for continued parking contravention $56

Part 3—Offences against the Australian Road Rules

Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules Fee
20 Speeding
Exceeding applicable speed limit on length of road—
by less than 10 kph $187
by 10 kph or more but less than 20 kph $422
by 20 kph or more but less than 30 kph $858
by 30 kph or more $1 560
27(1) Failing to keep left when starting left turn (from other than $359
multi-lane road)
28(1) Failing to keep within left lane when starting left turn on multi-lane $359
road
28(1A)  Failing to use slip lane when starting left turn on multi-lane road $359
28(2A) Bicycle rider starting left turn on multi-lane road from incorrect $63
position in bicycle storage area
29(1) Failing to make left turn as indicated by turn line $359
31(1) Starting right turn incorrectly (from other than multi-lane road) $359
32(1) Failing to keep within right lane when starting right turn (on $359
multi-lane road)
32(2A) Bicycle rider starting right turn on multi-lane road from incorrect $63
position in bicycle storage area
33(1) Making right turn at intersection incorrectly $359
34(1) Making hook turn at "hook turn only" sign incorrectly $323


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20Act%201961
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

No. 37 p. 1478 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022
Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules Fee
35(2) Bicycle rider making hook turn at intersection with no "hook turn $63
only" sign etc incorrectly

36 Bicycle rider making hook turn contrary to "no hook turn by $63
bicycles" sign

37 Starting U-turn without clear view etc $429

38 Failing to give way when making U-turn $429

39(1) Making U-turn contrary to "no U-turn" sign at break in dividing $404
Strip

39(2) Making U-turn contrary to "no U-turn" sign on length of road $404

40 Making U-turn at intersection with traffic lights and no "U-turn $404
permitted” sign

41 Making U-turn at intersection without traffic lights where "no $404
U-turn" sign

42 Starting U-turn at intersection from incorrect position $429

46(1) Failing to give left change of direction signal before turning left $352

46(4) Failing to stop giving left change of direction signal after turning $236
left

48(1) Failing to give right change of direction signal before turning right $352

48(4) Failing to stop giving right change of direction signal after turning $236
right

51 Using direction indicator lights when not permitted $236

53(1) Failing to give stop signal before stopping or suddenly slowing $352

53(2) Failing to give sufficient warning of stopping $352

53(3) Failing to give stop signal while slowing $352

56(1) Failing to stop for red traffic light $515

56(2) Failing to stop for red traffic arrow $515

57(1) Failing to stop for yellow traffic light $515

57(2) Failing to stop for yellow traffic arrow $515

57(3) Failing to leave intersection showing yellow traffic light or arrow $515

59(1) Proceeding through red traffic light $515

60 Proceeding through red traffic arrow $515

60A(1) Proceeding through bicycle storage area before red traffic light $404

60A(2) Proceeding through bicycle storage area before red traffic arrow $404

61(2) Failing to stop at intersection when traffic lights or arrows change $515
to yellow or red

61(5) Failing to leave intersection when traffic lights or arrows change to $515
yellow or red

62(1) Failing to give way when turning at intersection with traffic lights $476

63(2) Failing to give way at intersection with traffic lights not operating $476
or only partly operating—where traffic light-stop sign

63(3) Failing to give way at intersection with traffic lights not operating $476

or only partly operating—where no traffic light-stop sign


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1479

Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules Fee

64 Failing to give way at flashing yellow traffic arrow at intersection $476

65(2) Failing to give way at marked foot crossing (except at intersection) $453
with flashing yellow traffic light

66(1) Failing to stop for twin red lights (except at level crossing) $115

66(4) Proceeding after stopping for twin red lights (except at level $115
crossing)

67(1) Failing to stop and give way at "stop" sign or stop line at $476
intersection without traffic lights

68(1) Failing to stop and give way at "stop" sign or stop line at other $404
place

69(1) Failing to give way at "give way" sign or give way line at $476
intersection (except roundabout)

70 Failing to give way at "give way" sign at bridge or length of $476
narrow road

71(1) Failing to give way at "give way" sign or give way line at other $404
place

72(1) Failing to give way at intersection (except T-intersection or $476
roundabout)

73(1) Failing to give way at T-intersection $476

74(1) Failing to give way when entering road from road-related area or $429
adjacent land

75(1) Failing to give way when entering road-related area or adjacent $429
land from road

76(1) Moving into path of tram travelling in tram lane etc $236

76(2) Failing to move out of path of tram travelling in tram lane etc $236

77(1) Failing to give way to bus $236

78(1) Moving into path of police or emergency vehicle $476

78(2) Failing to move out of path of police or emergency vehicle $476

79(1) Failing to give way to police or emergency vehicle $476

80(2) Failing to stop at children's crossing $476

80(3) Failing to obey hand-held "stop" sign at children's crossing $404

80(4) Proceeding while pedestrian or bicycle rider on or entering $476
children's crossing

81(2) Failing to give way at pedestrian crossing $453

82 Overtaking or passing vehicle at children's crossing or pedestrian $453
crossing

83 Failing to give way to pedestrian in shared zone $376

84(1) Failing to give way when driving through break in dividing strip $429

85 Failing to give way on painted island $404

86(1) Failing to give way in median turning bays $429

87(1) Failing to give way when moving from side of road $388

87(3) Failing to give way when moving from median strip parking area $388

88(1) Failing to turn left at intersection with "left turn only" sign $404


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

No. 37 p. 1480 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022
Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules Fee
88(2) Failing to turn left when in left lane at intersection with "left lane $404
must turn left" sign

89(1) Failing to turn right at intersection with "right turn only" sign $404

89(2) Failing to turn right when in right lane at intersection with "right $404
lane must turn right" sign

90 Turning at intersection with "no turns" sign $404

91(1) Turning left at intersection or other place with "no left turn" sign $404

91(2) Turning at intersection or other place with "no right turn" sign $404

92(1) Failing to drive in direction indicated by traffic lane arrows $404

93(1) Driving or overtaking on bridge or length of road where "no $404
overtaking or passing" sign applies

94 Overtaking on bridge with "no overtaking on bridge" sign $404

95(1) Driving in emergency stopping lane $404

96(1) Stopping on area of road marked with "keep clear" marking $404

97(1) Driving on length of road where "road access" sign applies $404

98(1) Driving in wrong direction on length of road where "one-way" sign $476
applies

99(1) Failing to drive to left of "keep left" sign $404

99(2) Failing to drive to right of "keep right" sign $404

100 Driving past "no entry" sign $404

101(1)  Failing to stop before hand-held "stop" sign $404

101(2)  Proceeding after stopping for hand-held "stop" sign $404

101A(1) Driving on safety ramp or arrester bed $404

102(1)  Driving past "clearance"” or "low clearance" sign $404

103(1)  Driving past "bridge load limit (gross mass)" or "gross load limit" $404
sign—vehicle exceeding gross mass indicated by sign

103(2)  Driving past "bridge load limit (mass per axle group)" sign— $404
vehicle axle group carrying mass exceeding mass indicated by sign

104(1)  Driving past "no trucks" sign—vehicle GVM exceeding permitted $404
mass

104(2)  Driving truck past "no trucks" sign—vehicle or combination $404
exceeding permitted length

104(3)  Driving truck past "no trucks" sign where no mass or length $404
indicated

105 Failing to enter area indicated by "trucks must enter" sign $404

106(1)  Driving bus past "no buses" sign—bus exceeding mass indicated by $404
sign

106(2)  Driving bus past "no buses" sign—bus exceeding length indicated $404
by sign

106(3)  Driving bus past "no buses" sign where no mass or length indicated $404

107 Failing to enter area indicated by "buses must enter" sign $404

108(1)  Failing to drive truck or bus in low gear on length of road where $404

"trucks and buses low gear" sign applies


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1481
Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules Fee
111(1)  Failing to enter roundabout from multi-lane road or road with 2 or $404
more lines of traffic travelling in same direction correctly

112(2)  Failing to give required left change of direction signal before $352
entering roundabout

112(3)  Failing to continue left change of direction signal while in $352
roundabout

113(2)  Failing to give required right change of direction signal before $352
entering roundabout

113(3)  Failing to continue right change of direction signal while in $352
roundabout

114(1)  Failing to give way when entering roundabout $476

114(2)  Failing to give way to tram when driving in roundabout $476

115(1)  Failing to drive in roundabout to left of central traffic island $476

116 Failing to obey traffic lane arrows when driving in or leaving $404
roundabout

117(1)  Failing to give left change of direction signal when changing $352
marked lanes or lines of traffic in roundabout

117(2)  Failing to give right change of direction signal when changing $352
marked lanes or lines of traffic in roundabout

118(1)  Failing to give left change of direction signal when leaving $352
roundabout

118(2)  Failing to stop left change of direction signal after leaving $352
roundabout

119 Failing to give way by rider of bicycle or animal to vehicle leaving $63
roundabout

121 Failing to stop and give way at "stop" sign at level crossing $515

122 Failing to give way at "give way" sign or give way line at level $515
crossing

123 Entering level crossing when train or tram is approaching etc $515

124 Failing to leave level crossing as soon as safe to do so $515

125(1)  Unreasonably obstructing path of other driver or pedestrian $130

126 Failing to keep safe distance behind other vehicles $372

127(1)  Failing to keep required minimum distance behind long vehicle $270

128 Entering blocked intersection $274

128A(1) Entering blocked crossing $274

129(1)  Failing to keep to far left side of road $339

130(2)  Driving in right lane on certain multi-lane roads $287

131(1)  Failing to keep to left of oncoming vehicles $376

132(1)  Failing to keep to left of centre of road $429

132(2)  Failing to keep to left of dividing line $429

132(2A) Making U-turn across certain dividing lines $429

135(1)  Failing to keep to left of median strip $358

136 Driving in wrong direction on one-way service road $358


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

No. 37 p. 1482 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022
Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules Fee
137(1)  Failing to keep off dividing strip $270
138(1)  Failing to keep off painted island $287
140 Overtaking when not safe to do so $339
141(1)  Driver overtaking to left of other vehicle $372
141(2)  Bicycle rider overtaking to left of vehicle turning left $63
142(1)  Overtaking to right of vehicle turning right $388
143(1)  Passing or overtaking to left of turning left vehicle displaying "do $231
not overtake turning vehicle" sign

143(1A) Passing or overtaking to left of vehicle displaying "do not overtake $231
turning vehicle" sign

143(2)  Passing or overtaking to right of turning right vehicle displaying $231
"do not overtake turning vehicle" sign

144 Failing to keep safe distance when overtaking $339

145 Increasing speed while being overtaken $337

146(1)  Failing to drive within single marked lane $287

146(2)  Failing to drive within single line of traffic $287

147(1)  Moving from one marked lane to another marked lane across $287
continuous line

148(1)  Failing to give way when moving from one marked lane to another $370
marked lane

148(2)  Failing to give way when moving from one line of traffic to another $370
line of traffic

148A Failing to give way when diverging left or right within marked lane $370

149 Failing to give way when lines of traffic merge into single line of $370
traffic

150(1)  Driving on or across continuous white edge line $115

I51(1)  Riding motor bike or bicycle alongside more than 1 other rider on $115
non multi-lane road

151(2)  Riding motor bike or bicycle alongside more than 1 other rider in $115
marked lane

151(4)  Riding motor bike or bicycle more than 1.5 metres from another $115
rider

151A(2) Rider of motor bike engaging in unlawful lane filtering $422

152(1)  Driving in marked lane to which overhead lane control device $404
applies—failing to comply with rule

153(1)  Driving in bicycle lane $296

154(1)  Driving in bus lane $296

155(1)  Driving in tram lane $296

155A(1) Driving in tramway $296

156(1)  Driving in transit lane $296

157(1)  Driving in truck lane $296

159(1)  Driving in marked lane required to be used by particular kinds of $296

vehicles


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1483
Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules Fee
160(2)  Passing or overtaking to right of tram not at or near far left side of $372

road
160(3)  Passing or overtaking left turning etc tram not at or near far left $372

side of road
161(2)  Passing or overtaking to left of tram at or near the left side of road $372
161(3)  Passing or overtaking tram turning right or giving right change of $372

direction signal
162(1)  Driving past safety zone $476
163(1)  Driving past rear of stopped tram at tram stop $476
164(1)  Failing to stop when tram stops at tram stop $476
164A(1) Failing to stay stopped if tram stops alongside at tram stop $476
167 Stopping where "no stopping" sign applies $106
168(1)  Stopping where "no parking" sign applies $89
169 Stopping on road with continuous yellow edge line $108
170(1)  Stopping in intersection $106
170(2)  Stopping within 20 metres of intersection with traffic lights $106
170(3)  Stopping within 10 metres of intersection without traffic lights $108
171(1)  Stopping on or near children's crossing $106
172(1)  Stopping on or near pedestrian crossing (except at intersection) $106
173(1)  Stopping on or near marked foot crossing (except at intersection) $106
174(2)  Stopping at or near bicycle crossing lights (except at intersection) $106
175(1)  Stopping on or near level crossing $106
176(1)  Stopping on clearway $296
177(1)  Stopping on freeway $296
178 Stopping in emergency stopping lane $296
179(1)  Stopping in loading zone $75
179(2)  Stopping in loading zone—exceeding time in loading zone $75
180(1)  Stopping in truck zone $72
181(1)  Stopping in works zone $72
182(1)  Stopping in taxi zone $146
183(1)  Stopping in bus zone $146
184(1)  Stopping in minibus zone $106
185(1)  Stopping in permit zone $72
186(1)  Stopping in mail zone $§72
187(1)  Stopping in bus lane, transit lane or truck lane $296
187(2)  Stopping in bicycle lane $298
187(3)  Stopping in tram lane or tramway or on tram tracks $296
188 Stopping in shared zone $§72
189(1)  Double parking $106
190(1)  Stopping in or near safety zone $72


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

No. 37 p. 1484

THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

10 June 2022

Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules Fee

191 Stopping near obstruction $130

192(1)  Stopping on bridge, causeway, ramp or similar structure $106

192(2)  Stopping in tunnel or underpass $130

193(1)  Stopping on crest or curve outside built-up area $130

194(1)  Stopping near fire hydrant etc $89

195(1)  Stopping at or near bus stop $106

196(1)  Stopping at or near tram stop $106

197(1)  Stopping on path, dividing strip or nature strip $108

197(1A) Stopping on painted island $106

197(1B) Stopping on traffic island $106

198(1)  Obstructing access to and from footpath ramp etc $87

198(2)  Obstructing access to and from driveway etc $89

199(1)  Stopping near postbox $106

200(1)  Stopping heavy or long vehicle on road outside built-up area except $130
on shoulder of road

200(2)  Stopping heavy or long vehicle on road in built-up area for longer $130
than permitted time

201 Stopping on road with "bicycle parking" sign $72

202 Stopping on road with "motor bike parking" sign $72

203(1)  Stopping in parking area for people with disabilities $413

203A  Stopping in slip lane $106

205(1)  Parking for longer than indicated where "permissive parking" sign $58
applies

207(2)  Failing to pay fee etc for parking where fees payable $58

208(1)  Failing to park on road (except in median strip parking area) in $75
accordance with rule—parallel parking

208A(1) Failing to park in road-related area (except in median strip parking $72
area) in accordance with rule—parallel parking

209(2)  Failing to park in median strip parking area in accordance with $72
rule—parallel parking

210(1)  Failing to park in accordance with rule—angle parking $72

211(2)  Parking where there are parking bays—failing to park vehicle $56
wholly within parking bay

211(3)  Parking where there are parking bays—failing to park long or wide $56
vehicle in minimum number of parking bays needed to park vehicle

212(1)  Entering or leaving median strip parking area—contrary to sign $130

212(2)  Entering or leaving median strip parking area—failing to drive $130
forward

215(1)  Failing to use lights when driving at night or in hazardous weather $270
conditions

216(1)  Failing to use lights when towing vehicle at night or in hazardous $155

weather conditions


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1485
Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules Fee
217(1)  Using fog lights when not driving in fog or other hazardous $270
weather conditions

218(1)  Using headlights on high-beam $270

219 Using lights to dazzle other road users $270

220(1)  Stopping vehicle on road at night—failing to operate lights $270

221(1)  Using hazard warning lights $144

223 Riding animal-drawn vehicle at night or in hazardous weather $63
conditions—failing to operate lights

224 Using horn or similar warning device $205

225(1)  Driving vehicle with radar detector or similar device in or on $476
vehicle or trailer

225(2)  Having possession of radar detector or similar device while $476
travelling in or on vehicle or trailer

226(1)  Driving heavy vehicle not equipped with portable warning triangles $115

226(2)  Failing to produce warning triangles on demand $115

227(2)  Failing to use portable warning triangles in accordance with rule— $115
vehicle stopped or fallen load where speed limit is 80 kph or more

227(3)  Failing to use portable warning triangles in accordance with rule— $115
vehicle stopped or fallen load where speed limit is less than 80 kph

228 Pedestrian passing "no pedestrians" sign $54

229 Pedestrian on road to which "road access" sign applies $54

230(1)  Failing to cross road in accordance with rule $54

231(1)  Failing to cross road with pedestrian lights in accordance with rule $54

232(1)  Failing to cross road at traffic lights without pedestrian lights in $54
accordance with rule

233(1)  Crossing road to get on tram—crossing before tram stops at tram $54
stop

233(2)  Crossing road from tram—failing to comply with rule $54

234(1)  Crossing road near crossing for pedestrians $54

234(2)  Pedestrian staying on crossing longer than necessary to cross road $54

235(1)  Crossing level crossing $54

235(2)  Crossing level crossing while warning lights flashing etc $54

235(2A) Failing to finish crossing level crossing in accordance with rule if $54
warning lights start flashing etc

235A(2) Crossing pedestrian level crossing while there is a red pedestrian $54
light

235A(3) Failing to finish crossing pedestrian level crossing in accordance $54
with rule if red pedestrian light appears

236(1)  Pedestrian causing traffic hazard $54

236(2)  Pedestrian causing obstruction $54

236(4)  Pedestrian selling articles or conducting other activities on road $115

236(5)  Driver or passenger buying article or service from person on road $115


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

No. 37 p. 1486 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

10 June 2022

Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules

Fee

237(1)  Getting on or into moving vehicle
238(1)  Pedestrian travelling along road—failing to use footpath

238(2)  Pedestrian travelling along road—failing to keep to side or face
approaching traffic or walking abreast

239(1)  Pedestrian on bicycle path or separated footpath

239(3)  Pedestrian on bicycle path or separated footpath—failing to keep
out of path of bicycle etc

239A Travelling in or on wheeled recreational device or wheeled toy past
"no wheeled recreational devices or toys" sign

240(1)  Travelling in or on wheeled recreational device or wheeled toy on
certain types of roads

where travel in or on a wheeled recreational device in
contravention of subrule (1) on a road that is—

. a one-way road with 2 or more marked lanes (other
than bicycle lanes); or

. a two-way road with 2 or more marked lanes (other
than bicycle lanes), on either side of the road, for
vehicles travelling in the same direction; or

. aroad on which the speed limit is greater than
60 kph

in any other case

240(2)  Travelling in or on wheeled recreational device on declared roads
or at night or during certain times

where travel in or on a wheeled recreational device in
contravention of subrule (2) on a road that is—

. a one-way road with 2 or more marked lanes (other
than bicycle lanes); or

. a two-way road with 2 or more marked lanes (other
than bicycle lanes), on either side of the road, for
vehicles travelling in the same direction; or

. aroad on which the speed limit is greater than
60 kph

in any other case

240(3)  Travelling in or on wheeled toy on declared roads or during certain
times

241(1)  Travelling in or on wheeled recreational device or wheeled toy on
road—failing to keep to left or travelling abreast

where travel in or on a wheeled recreational device in
contravention of subrule (1) on a road that is—

. a one-way road with 2 or more marked lanes (other
than bicycle lanes); or

. a two-way road with 2 or more marked lanes (other
than bicycle lanes), on either side of the road, for
vehicles travelling in the same direction; or

. a road on which the speed limit is greater than
60 kph

$204
$54
$54

$54
$54

$63

$422

$63

$422

$63
$63

$422


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1487

Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules Fee
in any other case $63
242(1)  Travelling in or on wheeled recreational device or wheeled toy on $63

footpath or shared path—failing to keep left or give way

243(1)  Travelling on rollerblades etc on separated footpath designated for $63
pedestrians
243(2)  Travelling on rollerblades etc on bicycle path etc—failing to keep $63

out of path of bicycle

244(1)  Travelling in or on wheeled recreational device or wheeled toy that $63
is being towed by vehicle

244(2)  Travelling in or on wheeled recreational device or wheeled toy $115
while holding onto moving vehicle

244(3)  Travelling in or on wheeled recreational device or wheeled toy too $63
close to rear of moving motor vehicle

244B Travelling on motorised scooter—failing to wear approved bicycle $115
helmet
244C Travelling on motorised scooter on road or road-related area $115
245 Riding bicycle not in accordance with rule $63
246(1)  Carrying on bicycle more persons than bicycle designed to carry $63
246(2)  Passenger on bicycle—passenger failing to sit in passenger seat $63
246(3)  Riding bicycle with passenger not sitting in passenger seat $63
247(1)  Failing to ride in bicycle lane on road $63
247A(1) Bicycle rider failing to enter bicycle storage area correctly at $63
intersection with red traffic light or arrow
247B(1) Bicycle rider failing to give way when entering bicycle storage area $63
247B(2) Bicycle rider in bicycle storage area on multi-lane road failing to $63

give way to motor vehicles in certain lanes when traffic lights are
green or yellow

248(1)  Riding bicycle on crossing—failing to cross in accordance with $63
rule

249 Riding bicycle on separated footpath designated for pedestrians $63

250(2)  Riding bicycle on footpath or shared path—failing to keep to left or $63
give way

251 Riding bicycle on bicycle path etc—failing to keep to left of $63
oncoming bicycle riders on path

252(1)  Riding bicycle where "no bicycles" sign or no bicycles road $63
marking applies

253 Bicycle rider causing traffic hazard $63

254(1)  Bicycle being towed—riding towed bicycle $63

254(2)  Bicycle rider holding onto moving vehicle $115

255 Riding bicycle too close to rear of motor vehicle $63

256(1)  Riding bicycle—rider failing to wear approved bicycle helmet $115

256(2)  Passenger on bicycle—passenger failing to wear approved bicycle $115
helmet

256(3)  Riding bicycle with passenger not wearing approved bicycle helmet $115


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

No. 37 p. 1488 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022
Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules Fee
257(1)  Riding with person on bicycle trailer $63
258 Riding bicycle not equipped with brake or warning device $63
259 Riding bicycle at night or in hazardous weather conditions without $63

displaying lights etc
260(1)  Bicycle rider crossing contrary to red bicycle crossing light $63
261(1)  Bicycle rider crossing contrary to yellow bicycle crossing light $63
262(1)  Bicycle rider crossing at an intersection or other place with bicycle $63
crossing lights and traffic lights—failing to cross in accordance
with rule
264(1)  Failing to wear approved seatbelt—driver $403
265(1)  Failing to wear approved seatbelt, and be seated, in accordance $403
with rule—passenger 16 years old, or older
265(3)  Failing to ensure passengers 16 years old or older are wearing
approved seatbelts, and are seated, in accordance with rule—
failure in relation to 1 such passenger $403
failure in relation to more than 1 such passenger $476
266(1)  Failing to ensure passengers under 16 years old are restrained and
seated in accordance with rule—
failure in relation to 1 such passenger $403
failure in relation to more than 1 such passenger $476
268(1)  Travelling in or on part of motor vehicle not designed primarily for $403
carriage of passengers or goods
268(2)  Travelling in or on part of motor vehicle designed primarily for $403
carriage of goods unless enclosed and seatbelts fitted
268(3)  Travelling in or on motor vehicle with part of body outside window $205
or door
268(4)  Driving motor vehicle with part of passenger's body outside $205
window or door
268(4A) Driving motor vehicle with passenger in or on part of vehicle not $403
designed primarily for carriage of passengers or goods
268(4B) Driving motor vehicle with passenger in or on part of vehicle $403
designed primarily for carriage of goods unless enclosed and
seatbelts fitted
269(1)  Getting off or out of moving vehicle $204
269(3)  Creating hazard by opening door of vehicle, leaving door open etc $204
269(4)  Driving bus while doors not closed $372
270(1)  Riding motor bike without wearing approved helmet or with $312
passenger not wearing approved helmet
270(2)  Passenger on motor bike failing to wear approved helmet $312
271(1)  Riding on motor bike—rider failing to ride in correct position $149
271(2)  Riding on motor bike—passenger failing to ride in correct position $149
271(3)  Riding on motor bike—rider riding with passenger not riding $149

correctly


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1489

Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules Fee

271(4)  Riding on motor bike—riding with more than I passenger $149
(excluding passenger in sidecar or on seat other than pillion seat)

271(5)  Riding on motor bike—riding with more than permitted number of $149
passengers in sidecar or on seat

271(5A) Riding on motor bike—riding with passenger under 8 years old not $149

in sidecar

271(5B) Riding on motor bike—passenger in sidecar failing to be seated $149
safely

271(5C) Riding on motor bike—riding with passenger in sidecar not seated $149
safely

272 Passenger interfering with driver's control of vehicle etc $372

274 Failing to stop for red T light—tram driver $515

275 Failing to stop for yellow T light—tram driver $515

277 Proceeding after stopping for a red or yellow T light—tram driver $515

279(2)  Proceeding when white T light or white traffic arrow no longer $515
showing—tram driver proceeding before entering intersection

279(3)  Proceeding when white T light or white traffic arrow no longer $515
showing—tram driver failing to leave intersection

281 Failing to stop for red B light—bus driver $515

282 Failing to stop for yellow B light—bus driver $515

284 Proceeding after stopping for red or yellow B light—bus driver $515

286(2)  Proceeding when white B light or white traffic arrow no longer $515
showing—bus driver proceeding before entering intersection

286(3)  Proceeding when white B light or white traffic arrow no longer $515
showing—bus driver failing to leave intersection

288(1)  Driving on path $274

288(4)  Driving on path—failing to give way $270

289(1)  Driving on nature strip $270

289(2)  Driving on nature strip—failing to give way $270

290 Driving on traffic island $270

291 Making unnecessary noise or smoke while starting or driving $230

292(1)  Driving or towing vehicle carrying insecure or overhanging load $397

292A(1) Driving or towing vehicle carrying load without required load $397
restraint system

293(2)  Failing to remove from road things fallen from vehicle while $260
driving

294(1)  Towing vehicle without keeping control of vehicle being towed $155

294(2)  Towing trailer without keeping control of trailer $155

295(1)  Motor vehicle towing another vehicle with towline not in $155
accordance with rule

296(1)  Reversing vehicle when not safe to do so $476

296(2)  Reversing vehicle further than reasonably necessary $287

297(1)  Driving vehicle without having proper control of vehicle $205


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules

No. 37 p. 1490 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022
Rule Description of offence against Australian Road Rules Fee
297(1A) Driving vehicle with person or animal in lap $205
297(2)  Driving motor vehicle without clear view of road etc $205
297(3)  Riding motor bike with animal between rider and handlebars or in $205

other position that interferes with control of motor bike etc
298 Driving motor vehicle towing trailer with person in trailer $268
299(1)  Driving vehicle with TV or VDU in operation in vehicle $115
300(1)  Using mobile phone while driving vehicle $565
301(1)  Driver of motor vehicle leading animal $115
301(2)  Passenger in or on motor vehicle leading animal $115
301(3)  Rider of bicycle leading animal $63
302 Rider of animal on footpath or nature strip failing to give way to $63
pedestrian
303(1)  Riding animal alongside more than I other rider on non multi-lane $63
road
303(2) Riding animal alongside another rider in marked lane $63
303(4) Riding animal alongside another rider more than 1.5 metres from $63
other rider
304(1)  Failing to obey direction of police officer or authorised person $325
Part 4—Offences against the Road Traffic
(Miscellaneous) Regulations 2014
Regulation Description of offence against Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) Fee
Regulations 2014
39 Evasive action in relation to average speed camera $1 023
40(1) Heavy vehicles and minimum allowable travel time $627
42 Evasive action in relation to Safe-T-Cam photographic $627
detection device
49(8) Selling, or offering for sale, for use in motor vehicle seat belt $425
or part of seat belt not complying with requirements of
regulation or removed from vehicle in which previously used
50(5) Selling, or offering for sale, for use in motor vehicle child $425
restraint, harness etc, or part, not approved
51(2) Selling, or offering for sale, for use by motor bike rider or $425
passenger helmet not complying with standard
51(4) Selling, or offering for sale, for use by bicycle rider helmet not $425
meeting requirement
52(2) Selling, or offering for sale, for use by rider of wheeled $425
recreational device or wheeled toy helmet not meeting
requirement
53(2) Driving or towing on road light vehicle not complying with $111
requirements of regulation—vehicle altered from original
specifications
56(1) Bicycle rider towing vehicle other than bicycle trailer $63

complying with regulation or towing more than 1 vehicle


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Australian%20Road%20Rules
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20(Miscellaneous)%20Regulations%202014
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20(Miscellaneous)%20Regulations%202014

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1491
Regulation Description of offence against Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) Fee
Regulations 2014
64(2) Driving or towing vehicle on certain roads while transporting $334
dangerous substance
65(2) Light vehicle towing prohibited number of vehicles $334
66(1) Parking in certain public places
parking in City of Adelaide Park Lands $156
parking in other public place $72
67(3) Contravening notice prohibiting fishing or other specified $115
activities from specified bridge or causeway
68(1) Failing to ensure dog does not enter or remain on certain $244

bicycle paths

Part 5—Offences against the Road Traffic (Road Rules—
Ancillary and Miscellaneous Provisions)
Regulations 2014

Regulation Description of offence against Road Traffic (Road Rules— Fee
Ancillary and Miscellaneous Provisions) Regulations 2014
8(1) Speeding while driving road train
Exceeding a prescribed speed limit (road trains)—
by less than 10 kph $497
by 10 kph or more but less than 20 kph $640
by 20 kph or more but less than 30 kph $985
by 30 kph or more $1 756
8(2) Speeding while driving road train
Exceeding 40 kph speed limit—
by less than 10 kph $187
by 10 kph or more but less than 20 kph $422
by 20 kph or more but less than 30 kph $858
by 30 kph or more $1 560
11A(1) Driver of motor vehicle failing to pass rider of bicycle at a $339
sufficient distance from the bicycle
13(1) Driving or stopping in "bus only lane" $289
27(1) Crossing to or from tram stop other than at crossing for $54
pedestrians if within 20 metres of crossing or if tram has
stopped
30(1) Operator of electric personal transporter failing to provide $349
adequate instruction or reasonable supervision
30(2) Operator of electric personal transporter causing or $115

permitting person under 12 years, or person without safety
helmet complying with regulation and properly adjusted and
securely fastened, to ride or be carried on the transporter


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20(Miscellaneous)%20Regulations%202014
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20(Miscellaneous)%20Regulations%202014
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20(Road%20Rules%E2%80%94Ancillary%20and%20Miscellaneous%20Provisions)%20Regulations%202014
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20(Road%20Rules%E2%80%94Ancillary%20and%20Miscellaneous%20Provisions)%20Regulations%202014

No. 37 p. 1492 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022
Regulation Description of offence against Road Traffic (Road Rules— Fee
Ancillary and Miscellaneous Provisions) Regulations 2014
30A(2) Riding or being carried on electric personal transporter $115
without wearing safety helmet complying with regulation and

properly adjusted and securely fastened

30A(3)(a)  Riding electric personal transporter at a speed $194
exceeding 15 kph

30A(4) Riding electric personal transporter without due care or $115
attention efc

30A(5) Riding electric personal transporter without having proper $115
control of the transporter

30A(6) Rider of electric personal transporter causing or permitting $115
another person to ride or be carried on the transporter at the
same time

30A(7) Person in possession or control of electric personal $115
transporter causing or permitting person under 12 years to
ride or be carried on the transporter

30A(8) Riding electric personal transporter within 2 metres of motor $63
vehicle continuously for more than 200 metres

30A(9) Riding electric personal transporter on footpath or other $63
road-related area abreast of another wheeled recreational
device etc

30A(10) Riding electric personal transporter on footpath or other $63
road-related area without giving warning to pedestrians etc

30A(11) Riding electric personal transporter on crossing—failing to $63
comply with regulation

30A(12) Riding electric personal transporter at night or in hazardous $63
weather conditions without displaying lights etc

44(1) Learner or Pl driver using mobile phone while driving vehicle $565

Editorial note—

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Legislative Instruments Act 1978, the Minister has certified that, in
the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into operation as set out in

these regulations.

Made by the Governor

with the advice and consent of the Executive Council

on 10 June 2022
No 31 0f 2022


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20(Road%20Rules%E2%80%94Ancillary%20and%20Miscellaneous%20Provisions)%20Regulations%202014
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=subordleg&legtitle=Road%20Traffic%20(Road%20Rules%E2%80%94Ancillary%20and%20Miscellaneous%20Provisions)%20Regulations%202014
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Legislative%20Instruments%20Act%201978

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1493

South Australia

Motor Vehicles (Expiation Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2022

under the Motor Vehicles Act 1959

Contents

Part 1—Preliminary

1 Short title
2 Commencement
Part 2—Amendment of Motor Vehicles Regulations 2010
3 Amendment of Schedule 4—Demerit points
4 Substitution of Schedule 5
Schedule 5—Expiation fees
1 Offences against Motor Vehicles Act 1959
2 Offences against these regulations

Part 1—Preliminary
1—Short title

These regulations may be cited as the Motor Vehicles (Expiation Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2022.

2—Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2022.

Part 2—Amendment of Motor Vehicles Regulations 2010

3—Amendment of Schedule 4—Demerit points

Schedule 4, Part 2, clause 7, table, item relating to section 81 AC(3) of Motor Vehicles
Act 1959, column 2, description of offence—delete the description and substitute:

Contravening condition of prescribed motor bike licence referred to in section
814C(2) of Act

4—Substitution of Schedule 5
Schedule 5—delete the Schedule and substitute:

Schedule S—Expiation fees
1—Offences against Motor Vehicles Act 1959

Section Description of offence against Motor Vehicles Fee
Act 1959
9(1) Driving unregistered motor vehicle on road or causing $436

unregistered motor vehicle to stand on road


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Motor%20Vehicles%20Act%201959
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Motor%20Vehicles%20Act%201959
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Motor%20Vehicles%20Act%201959
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Motor%20Vehicles%20Act%201959

No. 37 p. 1494

THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

10 June 2022

Section

Description of offence against Motor Vehicles
Act 1959

Fee

9(3)

16(9)

16(11)
43A(3)

43A(7)

47(1)

47(1a)

47A(7)

47B(2)

47C(3)

47D(1)(a)

47D(1)(b)

47D(1)(c)

47D(1)(d)

47D(2)

56

66(2)

Being owner of unregistered motor vehicle driven or

found standing on road

Driving motor vehicle without carrying permit under
section 16 of Act

Contravening condition of permit under section 16 of Act

Causing or permitting unregistered heavy vehicle to be
driven on road

Failing to carry temporary configuration certificate in
vehicle or to produce it for inspection by police officer or
authorised officer

Driving, or causing to stand, motor vehicle not bearing
number plates

Being registered owner or registered operator of motor
vehicle driven, or caused to stand, in contravention of
section 47(1) of Act

Driving motor vehicle to which is attached number plates
in respect of which a declaration under section 47A(2) of
Act has been made without relevant agreement under
section 47A4(4)

Selling or supplying number plates without approval of
Minister

Failing to comply with direction of Registrar under
section 47C(2) of Act

Driving, or causing to stand, motor vehicle to which is
attached number plate bearing number other than
number allotted to vehicle

Driving, or causing to stand, motor vehicle to which is
attached number plate altered, defaced, mutilated or
added to

Driving, or causing to stand, motor vehicle to which is
attached colourable imitation of number plate

Without lawful excuse, having in possession number
plate or article resembling number plate

Being registered owner or registered operator of motor
vehicle driven, or caused to stand, in contravention of
section 47D(1)(a), (b) or (c) of Act

Failing to comply with requirements of section on
transfer of ownership of motor vehicle—

failing to lodge notice of transfer of ownership of
motor vehicle within 14 days after transfer in
accordance with section 56(b)(ii) where application
for cancellation of registration has not been made in
accordance with section 56(a)

If motor vehicle to which trade plates are affixed is
driven other than for a prescribed purpose stated in
application for issue of the plates, being driver or person
to whom plates were issued

$436

$153

$126
$436

$61

$770

$770

$770

$770

$349

$770

$770

$770

$770

$770

$291

$149


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Motor%20Vehicles%20Act%201959
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Motor%20Vehicles%20Act%201959

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

No. 37 p. 1495

Section

Description of offence against Motor Vehicles
Act 1959

Fee

71B(2)

72A(2)

74(1)
75A(14)

75A(15)(a)

75A(15)(b)

75A(20)

75A(24)

75A(25)

75B(1)

81(4)

81A(9)
81A(13)

81A(15)(a)

81A(15)(b)

81A(16)

Failure by person to whom replacement number plate,
trade plate or prescribed document issued to return
found or recovered original plate or document to
Registrar

Acting as qualified supervising driver while having
prescribed concentration of alcohol in blood or
prescribed drug in oral fluid or blood

Driving motor vehicle without currently holding
appropriate licence or learner's permit

Contravening condition of learner's permit

Holder of learner's permit driving motor bike on road
while no L plate affixed to bike in accordance with
regulations

Holder of learner's permit driving motor vehicle (other
than motor bike) on road while L plates not affixed to
vehicle in accordance with regulations—

only 1 L plate affixed to vehicle in accordance with
regulations

no L plates affixed to vehicle in accordance with
regulations

Holder of prescribed learner's permit driving motor bike
between midnight and 5.00 a.m.

Holder of learner's permit driving motor bike on road
carrying person on motor bike

Holder of learner's permit driving motor bike on road
towing vehicle by use of motor bike

Holder of restricted motor bike learner's permit driving
motor bike on road (other than in prescribed
circumstances)

Contravening condition endorsed on licence or permit
under section 81 of Act

Contravening condition of provisional licence

Holder of P1 or P2 licence under the age of 25 years
driving high powered vehicle

Holder of P1 licence driving motor bike on road while no
P plate affixed to bike in accordance with regulations

Holder of P1 licence driving motor vehicle (other than
motor bike) on road while P plates not affixed to vehicle
in accordance with regulations—

only 1 P plate affixed to vehicle in accordance with
regulations

no P plates affixed to vehicle in accordance with
regulations

Holder of P1 licence under the age of 25 years driving
between midnight and 5.00 a.m. without being
accompanied by a person acting as qualified supervising
driver

$149

$303

$527

$397
$397

$230

$397

$397

$397

$397

$397

$406

$397
$397

$397

$230

$397

$397


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Motor%20Vehicles%20Act%201959
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Motor%20Vehicles%20Act%201959

No. 37 p. 1496 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022

Section Description of offence against Motor Vehicles Fee
Act 1959

81A(18) Holder of P1 licence under the age of 25 years driving $397
with 2 or more peer passengers in the vehicle without
carrying person acting as qualified supervising driver

81AB(5) Contravening condition of probationary licence $406

81AC(3) Contravening condition of prescribed motor bike licence $786
referred to in section 814C(2) of Act

81B(3) Failing to comply with requirement made by Registrar

failure to attend lecture $130

96(1) Failing to produce licence or learner's permit on request $217
of police officer

97A(3) Failing to carry or produce licence while driving under $217
section 974 of Act

98AAA(]) Failing to carry or produce licence while driving heavy $217
vehicle

98AAB Failing to carry or produce probationary licence, $217
provisional licence or learner's permit while driving

102(1) Driving uninsured motor vehicle on road or causing $806
uninsured motor vehicle to stand on road

102(2) Being owner of uninsured motor vehicle driven or found $806
standing on road

136(1) Failing to notify Registrar of change of name or $214
residence of natural person who is registered owner or
registered operator of motor vehicle or holds licence or
learner's permit

136(2) Failing to notify Registrar of change of name or $214
principal place of business of natural person who holds
trade plates

136(2a) Failing to notify Registrar of change of principal place $214
of business of body corporate that is registered owner or
registered operator of motor vehicle or holds trade
plates

136(2b) Failing to notify Registrar of change of garage address $214
of motor vehicle

136(2¢) Failing to notify Registrar of change of registered $214
operator of motor vehicle

136(2d) Failing to notify Registrar of change of postal address $214

143(1) Causing or permitting another person to do or omit to do

anything in contravention of Act or regulations

causing or permitting commission of expiable
offence

the expiation
fee
prescribed
for the
expiable
offence


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Motor%20Vehicles%20Act%201959
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Motor%20Vehicles%20Act%201959

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1497

2—Offences against these regulations

Regulation  Description of offence against these regulations Fee

36(1) Driving motor vehicle on road while number plate or $527
trade plate obscured or distorted by device or substance

36(4) Driving motor vehicle on road while number plate on $527
bike rack obscured or distorted by device or substance

55E Failing to carry or produce certificate of exemption $237
while driving a high powered vehicle

74(7) Contravening or failing to comply with requirements of
regulation concerning written-off vehicle notices or
notification

alleged offence not committed in the course of a $352
trade or business

75(1) Driving written-off vehicle to or from place other than
place specified in regulation

alleged offence not committed in the course of a $352
trade or business

Editorial note—

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Legislative Instruments Act 1978, the Minister has certified that, in
the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into operation as set out in
these regulations.

Made by the Governor

with the advice and consent of the Executive Council
on 10 June 2022

No 32 0f 2022


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Legislative%20Instruments%20Act%201978

No. 37 p. 1498 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022

South Australia

Heavy Vehicle National Law (South Australia) (Expiation
Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022

under the Heavy Vehicle National Law (South Australia) Act 2013

Contents

Part 1—Preliminary
1 Short title
2 Commencement

Part 2—Amendment of Heavy Vehicle National Law (South Australia) (Expiation
Fees) Regulations 2013
3 Substitution of Schedule 1
Schedule 1—Offences, prescribed offences and expiation fees
Part 1—Offences against the local application provisions of the Act
Part 2—Prescribed offences against the Heavy Vehicle National Law (South Australia)
Division 1—Prescribed offences for purposes of section 591 of the Law
Division 2—Prescribed offences peculiar to South Australia

Part 3—Prescribed offences against the Heavy Vehicle (Mass, Dimension and Loading)
National Regulation (South Australia)

Part 4—Prescribed offences against the Heavy Vehicle (Fatigue Management) National
Regulation (South Australia)

Part 1—Preliminary

1—Short title

These regulations may be cited as the Heavy Vehicle National Law (South Australia)
(Expiation Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022.

2—Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2022.



10 June 2022

THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

No. 37 p. 1499

Part 2—Amendment of Heavy Vehicle National Law (South

Australia) (Expiation Fees) Regulations 2013

3—Substitution of Schedule 1
Schedule 1—delete the Schedule and substitute:

Schedule 1—Offences, prescribed offences and expiation

fees

Part 1—Offences against the local application provisions

of the Act
Section Description of offence Fee
19(2) Failure to comply with a direction given under section 19(1) $600
21(1) Sale or other disposal of a heavy vehicle in respect of which a vehicle $300
defect notice is in force
Part 2—Prescribed offences against the Heavy Vehicle
National Law (South Australia)
Division 1—Prescribed offences for purposes of section 591 of
the Law
Section Description of offence Fee
25A(1) Failure of driver of PBS vehicle to keep a copy of PBS vehicle approval $354
in driver's possession while driving the vehicle
25A(2) Failure of relevant party to ensure that driver complies with $354
section 25A4(1)
60(1) Using, or permitting the use of, a heavy vehicle that contravenes a heavy
vehicle standard—
(a) if the heavy vehicle standard relates to a speed limiter $711
(b)  in any other case $354
79(2) Failure to comply with notice to return vehicle standards exemption $471
(permit) to Regulator within specified period
81(1) Contravening a condition of a vehicle standards exemption $471
81(2) Using, or permitting the use of, a heavy vehicle that contravenes a $471
condition of a vehicle standards exemption
81(3) Using or permitting the use of a heavy vehicle in a way that contravenes $471
a condition of a vehicle standards exemption
82(2) Failure of driver to comply with condition under vehicle standards $354
exemption (notice) to keep relevant document in driver's possession
82(3) Failure of relevant party to ensure driver complies with section 82(2) $354
83(1) Failure of driver to keep a copy of vehicle standards exemption (permit) $354
in driver's possession
83(2) Failure of driver to return copy of vehicle standards exemption (permit) $354
to relevant party when driver stops working
83(3) Failure of relevant party to ensure driver complies with section 83(2) $354



No. 37 p. 1500 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022
Section Description of offence Fee
85(1) Modifying a heavy vehicle without approval by approved vehicle $354

examiner or Regulator
85(2) Using or permitting the use of a heavy vehicle that has been modified $354
without approval by approved vehicle examiner or Regulator
86(2) Failure of approved vehicle examiner to give approved certificate and $354
ensure plate or label is fitted or affixed to vehicle
87A(1) Tampering with plate or label fitted to or affixed to a heavy vehicle $354
under section 86(2) or 87(3)
89(1) Using or permitting the use of an unsafe heavy vehicle $711
90(1) Using or permitting the use of a heavy vehicle not fitted with emission $354
control system for each relevant emission
90(2) Using or permitting the use of emission control system that is not $354
operating in accordance with manufacturer's design
90(3) Using or permitting the use of an emission control system resulting in a $354
failure to comply with heavy vehicle standard
92(2) Using or permitting the use of a heavy vehicle displaying a warning sign $354
where the sign is not required to be displayed
96(1) Failure of person who drives, or permits another person to drive, a
heavy vehicle to ensure vehicle, components and load comply with mass
requirements—
(a)  for a minor risk breach $471
(b)  for a substantial risk breach $711
102(1)(a) Failure of person who drives, or permits another person to drive, a $354
heavy vehicle to ensure vehicle, components and load comply with
dimension requirements where vehicle does not have goods or
passengers in it
102(1)(b) Failure of person who drives, or permits another person to drive, a
heavy vehicle to ensure vehicle, components and load comply with
dimension requirements where vehicle has goods or passengers in it—
(a)  for a minor risk breach $354
(b) for a substantial risk breach $592
109(2) Using or permitting the use of a heavy vehicle without fixing the $354
required flag or light to back of the load
111(1) Failure of person who drives, or permits another person to drive, a
heavy vehicle to ensure vehicle, components and load comply with
loading requirements—
(a)  for a minor risk breach $354
(b)  for a substantial risk breach $592
129(1) Driver or operator of heavy vehicle contravening a condition of a mass $711
or dimension exemption
129(2) Using or permitting the use of a heavy vehicle that contravenes a $711
condition of a mass or dimension exemption
129(3) Using or permitting the use of a heavy vehicle in a way that contravenes $711
a condition of a mass or dimension exemption
130(2) Failure of driver of pilot or escort vehicle to comply with conditions of a $711

mass or dimension exemption



10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1501
Section Description of offence Fee
131(1) Failure of driver of a pilot vehicle to ensure that the accompanying $711
heavy vehicle is not contravening a condition of exemption

132(2) Failure of driver of class 1 or class 3 heavy vehicle to comply with $354
condition under mass or dimension exemption (notice) to keep relevant
document in driver's possession

132(3) Failure of relevant party to ensure driver complies with section 132(2) $354

133(1) Failure of driver of a class 1 or class 3 heavy vehicle to keep a copy of a $354
mass or dimension exemption (permit) in driver's possession

133(2) Failure of driver of a class 1 or class 3 heavy vehicle to return copy of $471
mass or dimension exemption (permit) to relevant party when driver
stops working

133(3) Failure of relevant party to ensure driver complies with section 133(1) $354

134(1) Displaying a heavy vehicle warning sign on a heavy vehicle not being $354
used under a dimension exemption

134(2) Displaying a pilot vehicle warning sign on a vehicle not being used as a $354
pilot vehicle for a heavy vehicle being used under a dimension
exemption

137 Using or permitting the use of a class 2 heavy vehicle other than in $711
accordance with a class 2 heavy vehicle authorisation

150(1) Driver or operator of a class 2 heavy vehicle contravening a condition $711
of a class 2 heavy vehicle authorisation

151(2) Failure of driver of a class 2 heavy vehicle to comply with a condition of $354
a class 2 heavy vehicle authorisation (notice) to keep relevant document
in driver's possession

151(3) Failure of relevant party to ensure driver complies with section 151(2) $354

152(1) Failure of driver of a class 2 heavy vehicle to keep copy of class 2 heavy $354
vehicle authorisation (permit) in driver's possession

152(2) Failure of driver to return copy of class 2 heavy vehicle authorisation $471
(permit) to relevant party

152(3) Failure of relevant party to ensure driver complies with section 152(1) $354

153A(1) Using or permitting the use of a restricted access vehicle on a road $711
other than one on which the vehicle is allowed to be used under an
applicable mass or dimension authority

181(3) Failure to comply with notice requiring return of permit for mass or $471
dimension authority to Regulator within specified time

184(1) Driving a heavy vehicle while towing more than I other vehicle other $354
than as permitted by section 184(2)

185(1) Using or permitting the use of a trailer not securely coupled to the $711
vehicle in front of it in a heavy combination

185(2) Using or permitting the use of incompatible or improperly connected $711
components of a coupling in a heavy combination

190(1) Failure of responsible entity to ensure operator or driver of a heavy $711
vehicle does not transport freight container without a complying
container weight declaration

191(1) Failure of operator of a heavy vehicle to ensure vehicle's driver does not $711

transport freight container without a complying container weight
declaration



No. 37 p. 1502 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022
Section Description of offence Fee
191(3) Failure of operator of a heavy vehicle to ensure freight container is not $711

given to carrier unless carrier has been provided with complying
container weight declaration or prescribed particulars
192(1) Driving a heavy vehicle loaded with freight container without a $711
complying container weight declaration for the container
192(2) Failure of driver of a heavy vehicle to keep the complying container $354
weight declaration in or about the vehicle and in a way readily
available to an authorised officer
250(1) Failure of solo driver of a fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to comply
with standard hours—
(a)  for a minor risk breach $471
(b)  for a substantial risk breach $711
(c) for a severe risk breach $1182
251(1) Failure of two-up driver of a fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to comply
with standard hours—
(a)  for a minor risk breach $471
(b) for a substantial risk breach $711
(c) for a severe risk breach $1182
254(1) Failure of solo driver of a fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to comply
with BFM hours—
(a)  for a minor risk breach $471
(b)  for a substantial risk breach $711
(c) for a severe risk breach $1182
256(1) Failure of two-up driver of a fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to comply
with BFM hours—
(a)  for a minor risk breach $471
(b)  for a substantial risk breach $711
(c) for a severe risk breach $1182
258(1) Failure of driver of fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to comply with AFM
hours—
(a)  for a minor risk breach $471
(b) for a substantial risk breach $711
260(1) Failure of driver of fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to comply with
exemption hours—
(a)  for a minor risk breach $471
(b)  for a substantial risk breach $711
263(1) Failure of driver of fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to comply with $471
change of work and rest hours option requirements
284(2) Failure to comply with notice to return work and rest hours exemption $711
(permit) to Regulator within specified period
286(1) Failure to comply with a condition of a work and rest hours exemption $711
287(2) Failure of driver of fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle operating under a $354

work and rest hours exemption (notice) to keep a relevant document in
driver's possession



10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1503
Section Description of offence Fee
287(3) Failure of relevant party to ensure driver complies with section 287(2) $354
288(1) Failure of driver of a fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to keep a copy of $354
work and rest hours exemption (permit) in the driver's possession

288(2) Failure of driver of a fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to return copy of $471
work and rest hours exemption (permit) to relevant party in certain
circumstances

288(3) Failure of relevant party to ensure driver complies with section 288(1) $354

293(1) Failure of driver of a fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to keep a work $711
diary, record required information and keep the diary in the driver's
possession

296(1) Failure of driver to record required information in work diary in the $177
manner and at the time prescribed by the national regulations

297(2) Failure of driver to record required information immediately after $711
starting work on a day

298(1) Failure of driver of a fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to record the $177
odometer reading as required by the national regulations

299 Failure of two-up driver to provide details prescribed by the national $354
regulations as requested by the other driver

301 Failure of driver to comply with requirements for recording information $177
in written work diary

302 Failure of driver to comply with requirements for recording information $177
in electronic work diary

303 Failure of driver to record time in work diary according to the time zone $177
of driver's base location

305(1) Failure of driver of fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to record required $711
information in supplementary record

305(2) Failure to comply with requirements for recording information in $354
supplementary record not in electronic form

305(3) Failure of driver to record time in supplementary record according to $177
the time zone of driver's base location

306 Failure of driver of fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to notify the $354
Regulator within 2 business days in the approved form when a written
work diary has been filled up, destroyed, lost or stolen

307(2) Failure of driver to notify the Regulator within 2 business days in the $354
approved form when an electronic work diary has been filled up,
destroyed, lost or stolen or is not in working order

307(3) Failure of driver to ensure electronic work diary is examined and $354
brought into working order within period required by Regulator

308(1) Failure of driver to comply with the requirements when an old work $354
diary is found or returned

309(2) Failure to inform the driver's record keeper within 2 business days of $354
becoming aware of a matter specified in section 309(1)

310(2) Failure to inform the driver's record keeper within 2 business days of $711
becoming aware of matters specified in section 310(1)

312(3) Failure of record keeper to notify the Regulator within 2 business days $711

of destroyed, lost or stolen electronic work diary



No. 37 p. 1504

THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

10 June 2022

Section

Description of offence

Fee

319(1)

319A(2)

321(1)

321(3)

322(2)

323(2)

324(2)

324A(2)

341(1)

341(2)

341(3)

341(4)

341(5)

341(7)

354(3)

354(5)

355(2)

355(4)

Failure of record keeper to comply with requirements specified in
section 319(1)

Failure of driver to record information specified in section 319(1)(a)(iii)
to (vi) within 24 hours or provide information specified in section 319(1)
to record keeper within 21 days

Failure of record keeper to comply with requirements specified in
section 321(1)

Failure of record keeper to record information required if driver is
operating under BFM or AFM hours

Failure of driver to give copy of work diary entry or supplementary
record to each record keeper within 21 days

Failure of driver to give new record keeper a copy of information
recorded in a work diary relating to the 28 day period before the change
to the new record keeper

Failure of record keeper to give driver who stops using the electronic
work diary a copy of information recorded in the diary for each day the
driver was using the diary

Failure of record keeper to give the driver a copy of the record or make
the record available etc

Failure of record keeper to keep records required under Division 3 for
3 years after specified day

Failure of record keeper to keep records required under Division 9 or
Division 10 for specified period

Failure of record keeper to ensure record (or copy) is readily available
to an authorised officer at the record location

Failure of driver who is his or her own record keeper to ensure record
(or copy) is readily available to an authorised officer at the record
location

Failure of record keeper to ensure record (or copy) is readable,
reasonably capable of being understood and capable of being used as
evidence

Failure of record keeper to ensure information recorded in an electronic
work diary is maintained so as to comply with the Regulator's conditions
and manufacturer's instructions

Failure of holder of an electronic recording system approval to comply
with a direction of the Regulator

Failure of a person to whom a notice has been given of amended
conditions of an electronic recording system approval to give a copy of
the notice to each person supplied by that person with an electronic
recording system or a device forming part of the system

Failure of holder of approval of an electronic recording system that
constitutes a part or the whole of an electronic work diary to remove
any electronic message on the system's visual display within the period
required by the Regulator

Failure of holder of an approval to comply with a direction of the
Regulator

$711

$354

$711

$711

$354

$354

$354

$177

$711

$711

$354

$354

$711

$177

$711

$711

$711

$711



10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1505

Section Description of offence Fee

355(6) Failure of person to whom a notice that the approval has been cancelled $711
to give a notice to each other person to whom the person has supplied
an electronic recording system the subject of the approval that the
approval has been cancelled

373(2) Failure to comply with notice requiring return of work diary exemption $711
(permit) to Regulator

375 Contravention of a condition of a work diary exemption $711

376(2) Failure of driver of a fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to comply with a $354

condition under a work diary exemption (notice) to keep relevant
document in driver's possession

376(3) Failure of relevant party to ensure driver complies with section 376(2) $354

377 Failure of a driver of a fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to keep a copy of $354
work diary exemption (permit) in the driver's possession

392(2) Failure to comply with notice requiring return of fatigue record keeping $711
exemption (permit) to Regulator

395 Contravention of a condition of a fatigue record keeping exemption $711

396(2) Failure of owner of a fatigue-regulated heavy vehicle to maintain $711
odometer in accordance with requirements prescribed by the national
regulations

399(2) Driving or permitting a person to drive a fatigue-regulated heavy $711

vehicle without complying with section 398

466(2a) Operator must attach the accreditation label for a relevant vehicle in a $354
way that the label is readable from the outside; and is not obscured,
defaced or otherwise not legible

466(2b) A person must not drive a relevant vehicle if the vehicle's accreditation $354
label is not attached to the vehicle; or, is attached to the vehicle in a
way that the label is wholly or partly obscured, defaced or otherwise not

legible

467 Failure of holder of BFM or AFM accreditation to comply with $711
accreditation conditions

468(1) Failure of driver operating under BFM accreditation or AFM $354
accreditation to keep certain documents in driver's possession

468(3) Failure of operator to ensure driver complies with section 468(1) $354

469(2) Failure of driver operating under a BFM accreditation or AFM $471
accreditation to return document to operator as soon as reasonably
practicable

470(3) Failure of operator to inform driver operating under AFM accreditation $711
of the AFM hours applying under the accreditation

470(8) Failure of operator to comply with a requirement under section 470(7) $354

471(2) Failure of operator to give notice to driver or scheduler of amendment, $711

suspension or cessation of heavy vehicle accreditation

471(3) Failure of driver to return to the operator any document relevant to the $471
notice given to the driver by the operator for the purposes of
section 468(1)

476(2) Failure to return accreditation certificate to Regulator within specified $711
period

488 Failure to return identity card to Regulator within specified period $471



No. 37 p. 1506 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022
Section Description of offence Fee
513(4) Failure to comply with a direction given under section 513(1) $711
514(3) Failure to comply with a direction given under section 514(1) $711
516(3) Failure to comply with a direction given under section 516(1) $711
517(4) Failure to comply with a direction given under section 517(2) $711
522(5) Failure to produce a heavy vehicle for inspection at the place and time $711

stated in the notice
524(5) Failure to comply with a direction given under section 524(2) or (3) $711
526(4) Failure of driver of a heavy vehicle who is not the operator of the $354
vehicle to give vehicle defect notice to operator as soon as practicable
within 14 days after notice issued
528(3) Removing or defacing a defective vehicle label attached to a heavy $354
vehicle
529 Using or permitting the use of a heavy vehicle in contravention of a
vehicle defect notice—
(a) for a major defect notice or minor defect notice $711
(b)  for a self-clearing defect notice $354
531(4) Failure of person who is not the operator of a heavy vehicle who is $354
given notice of an amendment or withdrawal, to give the notice to the
operator as soon as reasonably practicable
533(7) Failure to comply with a direction given under section 533 $1182
534(5) Failure to comply with a direction given under section 534 $1182
567(4) Failure to comply with a requirement made under section 567(2) or (3) $354
568(3) Failure to comply with a requirement made under section 568(2)—
(a) if the requirement is for the driver to produce the driver's $711
driver licence under subsection (2)(a)
(b) if the requirement is for the driver to produce a document, An amount
device or other thing under subsection (2)(b) equal to 10%
of the amount
of the
maximum
penalty for an
offence of
failing to keep
the document,
device or other
thing in the
driver's
possession
568(7) Failure to comply with a requirement given under section 568(6) $354
569(2) Failure to comply with a requirement made under section 569(1) $711
569(7) Failure to comply with a requirement made under section 569(6) $354
Division 2—Prescribed offences peculiar to South Australia
Section Description of offence Fee
322(4) Failure of record keeper to ensure driver complies with section 322(2) $354



10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1507

Section Description of offence Fee

577(4) Failure to comply with a requirement made under section 577(1) or (2) $1182

Part 3—Prescribed offences against the Heavy Vehicle
(Mass, Dimension and Loading) National Regulation

(South Australia)
Regulation Description of offence Fee
16(2) Using or permitting the use of HML heavy vehicle under higher mass $354

limits in an area or on a route to which the HML declaration applies
where vehicle is neither equipped for monitoring by an approved
intelligent transport system nor covered by an intelligent access

agreement

28 Driver or operator of HML heavy vehicle contravening a condition of $354
HML permit

34(2) Failure to comply with a notice to return HML permit $471

Part 4—Prescribed offences against the Heavy Vehicle
(Fatigue Management) National Regulation (South

Australia)
Regulation Description of offence Fee
18A(1) Failure of driver on changing from 1 form of work diary to another to $177

record certain information in compliance with subsection (2)
Editorial note—

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Legislative Instruments Act 1978, the Minister has certified that, in
the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into operation as set out in
these regulations.

Made by the Governor

with the advice and consent of the Executive Council
on 10 June 2022

No 33 0f 2022


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Legislative%20Instruments%20Act%201978

No. 37 p. 1508 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022

South Australia

Expiation of Offences (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022

under the Expiation of Offences Act 1996

Contents

Part 1—Preliminary

1 Short title

2 Commencement

Part 2—Amendment of Expiation of Offences Regulations 2011
3 Amendment of regulation 5—Reminder notices

4 Amendment of regulation 6—Expiation enforcement warning notices

Part 1—Preliminary

1—Short title

These regulations may be cited as the Expiation of Offences (Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2022.

2—Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2022.

Part 2—Amendment of Expiation of Offences Regulations 2011

3—Amendment of regulation S—Reminder notices
Regulation 5(a)—delete "$67.00" and substitute:
$68.00

4—Amendment of regulation 6—Expiation enforcement warning notices
Regulation 6(a)—delete "$60.00" and substitute:
$61.00
Editorial note—

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Legislative Instruments Act 1978, the Minister has certified that, in
the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into operation as set out in
these regulations.

Made by the Governor

with the advice and consent of the Executive Council
on 10 June 2022

No 34 of 2022


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Legislative%20Instruments%20Act%201978

10 June 2022 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE No. 37 p. 1509

South Australia

Victims of Crime (Fund and Levy) Amendment
Regulations 2022

under the Victims of Crime Act 2001

Contents

Part 1—Preliminary

1 Short title

2 Commencement

Part 2—Amendment of Victims of Crime (Fund and Levy) Regulations 2018
3 Amendment of Schedule 1—Victims of crime levy

Part 1—Preliminary
1—Short title

These regulations may be cited as the Victims of Crime (Fund and Levy) Amendment
Regulations 2022.

2—Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2022.

Part 2—Amendment of Victims of Crime (Fund and Levy)
Regulations 2018

3—Amendment of Schedule 1—Victims of crime levy
(1) Schedule 1, clause 1(a)(i)—delete "$92" and substitute:

$94

(2) Schedule 1, clause 1(a)(ii)—delete "$245" and substitute:
$250

(3) Schedule 1, clause 1(b)—delete "$397" and substitute:
$405

Editorial Note—

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Legislative Instruments Act 1978, the Minister has certified that, in
the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into operation as set out in
these regulations.

Made by the Governor

with the advice and consent of the Executive Council
on 10 June 2022

No 35 0f 2022


http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Legislative%20Instruments%20Act%201978

No. 37 p. 1510 THE SOUTH AUSTRALIAN GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 10 June 2022

All instruments appearing in this gazette are to be considered official, and obeyed as such

Printed and published weekly by authority of S. SMITH, Government Printer, South Australia
$8.00 per issue (plus postage), $402.00 per annual subscription—GST inclusive
Online publications: www.governmentgazette.sa.gov.au



http://www.governmentgazette.sa.gov.au/

	Governor’s Instruments
	Appointments 1454
	Proclamation—
	Youth Court (Designation and Classification of  Magistrates) Proclamation 2022 1456

	Regulations—
	Private Parking Areas (Expiation Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022—No. 26 of 2022 1457
	Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022—No. 27 of 2022 1459
	Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery (Prescribed  Amounts) Amendment Regulations 2022— No. 28 of 2022 1461
	Environment Protection (Fees) Amendment  Regulations 2022—No. 29 of 2022 1463
	Mining (Rental Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022— No. 30 of 2022 1468
	Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) (Expiation Fees)  Amendment Regulations 2022—No. 31 of 2022 1470
	Motor Vehicles (Expiation Fees) Amendment  Regulations 2022—No. 32 of 2022 1493
	Heavy Vehicle National Law (South Australia)  (Expiation Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022— No. 33 of 2022 1498
	Expiation of Offences (Fees) Amendment  Regulations 2022—No. 34 of 2022 1508
	Victims of Crime (Fund and Levy) Amendment Regulations 2022— No. 35 of 2022 1509


	Governor’s Instruments
	APPOINTMENTS
	PROCLAMATION
	Youth Court (Designation and Classification of Magistrates) Proclamation 2022

	Regulations
	Private Parking Areas (Expiation Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022
	Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022
	Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery (Prescribed Amounts) Amendment Regulations 2022
	Environment Protection (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022
	Mining (Rental Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022
	Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) (Expiation Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022
	Motor Vehicles (Expiation Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022
	Heavy Vehicle National Law (South Australia) (Expiation Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022
	Expiation of Offences (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2022
	Victims of Crime (Fund and Levy) Amendment Regulations 2022



